
Rhea Glassman Plosker <rhea@geerz.org>

12700 - waiting on Darchei Ish to send asmachta.

Deposit Geerz Israel Dec 8- Dec 25

Rhea Glassman Plosker <rhea@geerz.org> Thu, Dec 26, 2024 at 2:24 PM
Reply-To: rhea@geerz.org
To: Tobey Finkelstein <tobey@geerz.org>
Cc: Shana Geerz Admin <shana@geerz.org>

See my comments in red. Shana, there are some questions below in blue from Tobey you need to address.

Rhea Glassman Plosker
Operations Manager

+972-54-658-0646

US: 516-464-8150 (Israel Standard Time)

    

On Thu, Dec 26, 2024 at 10:54 AM Tobey Finkelstein <tobey@geerz.org> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]
I believe this is Darchei Ish. I just asked them for an asmachta for their bank transfer which totals this amount.

 
 

4) 1,000 JGive Dec 15, 2024
Anonymous :( 

5) 200 NIS Dec 16, 2024 Goldstein (Payment for BS)

תאריך רישום תאריך ערך שם בנק סניף חשבון סכום סוג תנועה אסמכתא הערות

16/12/2024 16/12/24 גולדשטיין 12 446 000671266 200.00 זיכוי מבנק 131091 חוג אופניים

Done.
6) 1,500 NIS Dec 19, 2024 קאסה דסליי (payment for BS)

תאריך רישום תאריך ערך שם בנק סניף חשבון סכום סוג תנועה אסמכתא הערות

19/12/2024 19/12/24 קאסה דסליי ו/או 46 515 105201383 1,500.00 זיכוי מבנק 192851 עבור חוג אופנים ליעוז קאסה )ה)

Done.
7) 10,360 NIS Jgive Dec 22, 2024

(Rael Gordon & Ethan Benovitz - Entered in CMS) 
 

8) 2,000 NIS Dec 23, 2024 Dovid Lipshitz  - GIG ?

תאריך רישום תאריך ערך שם בנק סניף חשבון סכום סוג תנועה אסמכתא הערות

23/12/2024 23/12/24 דוד מנחם ליפשיץ, רחל אסתר ליפשיץ 10 916 007043546 2,000.00 זיכוי ...2412  זיכוי מידי

How do I contact this person to see where this donation should be applied? No contact info. We have a Moshe & Rachel Lifshitz in the system... a Daniel
Lifshitz... but no David & Rachel Lifshitz. Moshe is a rider - can I reach out to him to see if he knows David Lifshitz and get his contact info?
This is donor 232 - Davi Lipschitz
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