
Rhea Glassman Plosker <rhea@geerz.org>

Fwd: deposit
Shana Geerz Admin <admin@geerz.org> Mon, May 8, 2023 at 12:38 PM
To: Rhea Glassman Plosker <rhea@geerz.org>, nwasosky <nwasosky@gmail.com>, Chaim Wizman <chaim@geerz.org>

Deposit geerz USA:
1) Pollack $100 monthly donation
2) $324.36  - American Online Giving - Benevity
Paul, Weiss, Rifkind, Wharton & Gar

3) $100 Charity Aid Foundation
CyberGrants

I hope these are donations you are waiting for and can match them to donors!

Shana Wasosky
Geerz 
admin@geerz.org

www.geerz.org

www.facebook.com/GeerzIsrael/

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Neil Olesky <Neil@westernsteelcs.com>
Date: Thu, May 4, 2023 at 10:43 PM
Subject: deposit
To: Shana Wasosky <admin@geerz.org>

Have a fantastic day😊
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