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Fwd: Grant summary for Geerz

Rhea Glassman Plosker <rhea@geerz.org> Mon, Oct 7, 2024 at 3:07 PM
To: Rhea Glassman Plosker <rhea@geerz.org>

All in and includes Martin Unger donation from march 20 - but it wasn't in remittance.

Operations Manager
+972-54-658-0646
US: 516-464-8150 (Israel Standard Time)
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On Tue, Jul 9, 2024 at 11:31 AM Rhea Glassman Plosker <rhea@geerz.org> wrote:
Not yet. I'm in the middle of it. I'll cc you on my email to Ne'eman about this...

Rhea Glassman Plosker

Geerz

WWW.geerz.org
www.facebook.com/Geerz4Life/

On Thu, Jun 27, 2024, 21:24 Shana Geerz Admin <admin@geerz.org> wrote:
Was this taken care of?
Shana

Senior Quality Manager
+972-52-727-5784
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—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Neeman Foundation Canada <receipts@neemanfoundation.com>
Date: Wed, Jun 26, 2024 at 2:03 PM

Subject: Grant summary for Geerz

To: <rhea@geerz.org>, <admin@geerz.org>, <chaim@geerz.org>

XX Ne’eman Foundation

’ — Canada S

Ne'eman Foundation Canada, 160 Faywood Blvd., Toronto, ON M3H 2X9 Canada (888) 341-8590
contact@neemanfoundation.com www.neemanfoundation.com
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Notice of Transfer of Funds

27 May 2024
To: Geerz

We are pleased to inform you that we have received donations in the amount of $19,542.45 and have allocated a
grant to your organization for its programs. These funds are being paid to you, the Grantee, in accordance with
our Grant and/or Agency Agreement.

These funds are being transferred to your organization's bank account at Pagi on 27 May 2024.

This grant is a one-time grant. By receiving this transfer, the Grantee: (i) represents and warrants that it is not in
violation of any of the terms and conditions of the Grant and/or Agency Agreement and there have been no
changes in the representations it made in the Agreement and (ii) agrees that it shall continue to perform its
obligations under the Grant and/or Agency Agreement.

The total amount of the transfer is as follows:

Initial Donation:  $19,542.45
Management fee: $476.09
Platform fee: $0.00
Clearing fee: $514.11
Total fee: $990.14

Balance: $18,552.31
Conversion Rate To N.I.S - 2.65

Transfer Amount NIS m 49,163.63

Kindly issue us a receipt for this amount within 30 days.

Thank you and best wishes.

Chaim Katz, President
Ne'eman Foundation Canada

Official receipt for income tax purposes
Registration Number 81095 6565 RR0001
CRA Website — canada.ca/charities-giving

Boutique Philanthropy
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