M Gma il Rhea Glassman Plosker <rhea@geerz.org>

Fwd: ILS transfers - Achisomoch

Shana Geerz Admin <admin@geerz.org> Fri, Apr 7, 2023 at 12:02 PM
To: Rhea Glassman Plosker <rhea@geerz.org>

This came in .. | sent you a screenshot

On Sun, Apr 2, 2023, 3:30 PM Rhea Glassman Plosker <rhea@geerz.org> wrote:
Thanks - when it comes I'll put it in.

www.geerz.org
www.facebook.com/Geerz4Life/
054-658-0646

On Sun, Apr 2, 2023 at 12:26 PM Shana Geerz Admin <admin@geerz.org> wrote:
FYI- but it is not in yet

admin@geerz.org
www.geerz.org

www.facebook.com/Geerzlsrael/

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Daniel Dormon <d.dormon@equalsconnect.com>
Date: Fri, Mar 31, 2023 at 1:38 PM

Subject: ILS transfers - Achisomoch

To: admin@geerz.org <admin@geerz.org>

Dear GEERZ ISRAEL,

| can confirm that a payment of 36903.47 ILS (8336 GBP) has been sent to you today from Achisomoch using
payment reference Achisomoch-399241.

Funds should arrive in your account within 2-3 working days.
Many thanks,
Daniel @ Equals Connect

For any queries, please email charity-support@achisomoch.org

This e-mail message may contain confidential or legally privileged information and is intended only for the use of the intended recipient(s). Any unauthori
sed disclosure, dissemination, distribution, copying or the taking of any action in reliance on the information herein is prohibited. E-mails are not secure
and cannot be guaranteed to be error free as they can be intercepted, amended, or contain viruses. Anyone who communicates with us by e-mail is dee
med to have accepted these risks. Equals Group is not responsible for errors or omissions in this message and denies any responsibility for any damag
e arising from the use of e-mail. Any opinion and other statement contained in this message and any attachment are solely those of the author and do n
ot necessarily represent those of the company. Equals Money Plc. Registered Address: 3rd Floor, Vintners’ Place, 68 Upper Thames St, London, EC4V
3BJ. Company registered in England and Wales. Registered number: 05539698. Money Service Business Registered Number: 12236741
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