
Rhea Glassman Plosker <rhea@geerz.org>

Asked Shana to check Benevity about Greystone donation

Re: deposit 2/8/23 *********** (PLUS $1000.00 CASH)*********
Shana Geerz Admin <admin@geerz.org> Wed, Feb 8, 2023 at 11:32 PM
To: Rhea Glassman Plosker <rhea@geerz.org>, Chaim Wizman <chaim@geerz.org>, nwasosky <nwasosky@gmail.com>

ll the following was deposited in Geerz USA - they need to please be put in the system.
1) $1000 cash - Nachum please give Rhea the instructions about this
2) $149.78 
American online for Giving a Partner of Benevity
Cannot figure out who this is from....obviously is a $150 donation that they took a bit from. It does say Greystone & CO in
one spot, but no indication if this is related to the donor or not.
3) $180
Jewish Foundation of Memphis
Shana & Brad Somer Philanthropic Fund
4679 The Forest Gate Road, Memphis TN 38120-2535
Sponsoring Aron Allen
4) $180
Jewish Communal Fund
Neugroschi Family CHaritable Fund
Mr. Jeffrey Neugroschi 
100 Edgemonth Place
Teaneck, NJ 07666
5) $500
Jewish Communal Fund
Rachel & Alan Jacoby Charity Fund
Alan & Rachel Jacoby
Shvil Ha'Zahav #6 Apt 42
Raanana, Israel

Shana Wasosky
Geerz 
admin@geerz.org

www.geerz.org

www.facebook.com/GeerzIsrael/

On Wed, Feb 8, 2023 at 5:03 PM Neil Olesky <Neil@westernsteelcs.com> wrote:

 

https://www.google.com/maps/search/4679+The+Forest+Gate+Road,+Memphis+TN+38120-2535?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Shvil+Ha+Zahav%C2%A0%236+Apt+42+Raanana,+Israel?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Shvil+Ha+Zahav%C2%A0%236+Apt+42+Raanana,+Israel?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/Shvil+Ha+Zahav%C2%A0%236+Apt+42+Raanana,+Israel?entry=gmail&source=g
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